
Public Notice
STATE OF WISCONSIN CIRCUIT 

COURT
MILWAUKEE COUNTY

IN RE: THE MARRIAGE OF
Petitioner: 

Cassie Ann Marie Joyce
802 S. 96th Street

West Allis WI 53214
and

Respondant: 
Bradley Gene Gouge

1060 State Street
Garner IA 50438

Case No. 21FA001569
HON. CAROLINA MARIA STARK, 

BR. 17
FAMILY B

Summons Without Minor 
Children

Divorce – 40101
	 The State of Wisconsin, to the 
person named above as respon-
dent:
	 You are notified that your spouse 
has filed a lawsuit or other legal 
action against you. The Petition, 
which is attached, states the nature 
and basis of the legal action.
	 Within 20 days of receiving the 
Summons, you must provide a writ-
ten response, as that term is used in 
ch. 802, Wis. Stats., to the Petition. 
The court may reject or disregard a 
response that does not follow the 
requirements of the statues.
	 The response must be sent or de-
livered to the following government 
office:
	 Clerk of Court
	 Name of county: Milwaukee
	 Address: 901 N 9th St.
	 Milwaukee, WI 53233
	 The response must also be 
mailed or delivered within 20 days 
to the petitioner at the address 
above.
	 It is recommended, but not re-
quired, that you have an attorney 
help or represent you.
	 If you do not provide a proper 
response within 20 days, the court 
may grant judgment against you, 
and you may lose your right to ob-
ject to anything that is or may be 
incorrect in the Petition.
	 A judgment may be enforced as 
provided by law. A judgment may 
become a lien against any real es-
tate you own now or in the future, 
and may also be enforced by gar-
nishment or seizure of property.
	 If you require reasonable accom-
modations due to a disability to par-
ticipate in the court process, please 
call __ prior to the scheduled court 
date. Please note that the court 
does not provide transportation.
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